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Township of West Orange
Essex County, New Jersey

Resolution No.126-20
June 23, 2020

Resolution: Approval to submit a grant application and execute a grant contract with the
New Jersey Department of Transportation for the Various Roads Improvement
Project.

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED that the Mayor and Council of the Township of
West Orange formally approve the grant application for the above stated project.

BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED that the Mayor and Clerk are hereby authorized to submit an
electronic grant application identified as “MA-2021-Various Roads Improvement Project-00339”
to the New Jersey Department of Transportation on behalf of the Township of West Orange.

BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED that the Mayor and Clerk are hereby authorized to sign the
grant agreement on behalf of the Township of West Orange and that their signatures constitute
acceptance of the terms and conditions of the grant agreement and approve the execution of the
grant agreement.

Certified as a true copy of the Resolution adopted by the Mayor and Council
On this 23rd day of June, 2020.

____________________________ ____________________________
Karen J. Carnevale, RMC Robert D. Parisi, Mayor
Municipal Clerk

My signature and the Clerk’s seal serve to acknowledge the above resolution and constitute
acceptance of the terms and conditions of the grant agreement and approve the execution of the
grant agreement as authorized by the resolution above.

ATTEST and AFFIX SEAL   _________________________
________________________

Karen J. Carnevale, RMC Michelle Casalino
Municipal Clerk Council President



127-20
June 23, 2020

RESOLUTION

WHEREAS, the following charitable organization(s) have applied for a Raffle License 
which raffle is to be conducted within the Township of West Orange,

NOW THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED by the Township Council of the Township of West 
Orange, that the Municipal Clerk is hereby authorized to issue a license to conduct a raffle by 
the following organization (s) at the place (s) and time(s) set opposite their respective name(s):

Organization Date/Type of Event Place           RL No.

Seton Hall Prep School November 5, 2020 Mayfair Farms 7688
Mothers Auxiliary Off Premise Merchandise 481 Eagle Rock Avenue
120 Northfield Avenue  
West Orange, NJ  07052

Seton Hall Prep School November 5, 2020 Mayfair Farms 7689
Mothers Auxiliary Tricky Tray  481 Eagle Rock Avenue
120 Northfield Avenue  
West Orange, NJ  07052

Seton Hall Prep School November 5, 2020 Mayfair Farms 7690
Mothers Auxiliary On Premise 50-50  481 Eagle Rock Avenue
120 Northfield Avenue  
West Orange, NJ  07052
 

 

 

                                                                                                                                                                        
Karen J. Carnevale, R.M.C. Michelle Casalino
Municipal Clerk Council President

Adopted: June 23, 2020



RESOLUTION

WHEREAS, the Township of West Orange has advertised for bids, pursuant to the New Jersey 

Local Public Contracts Law (N.J.S.A. 40A:11-1) for the project Pleasant Valley Way Parking Lot 

Reconstruction.

WHEREAS, at the date time and place advertised for the opening of said bids, the Township did 

received six bids; and

WHEREAS, the Township Engineer reported that the successful bidder has strictly complied with

the bid specifications and is the lowest responsible bidder; and

WHEREAS, the Township Council of the Township of West Orange has considered said bids and 

has further considered the recommendation of the Township Engineer as to the award of said bid.

NOW, THEREFORE BE IT RESOLVED by the Township Council of the Township of West Orange 

that the contract for the Pleasant Valley Way Parking Lot Reconstruction is hereby awarded to:

ZENITH CONSTRUCTION SERVICES, INC.

365 THOMAS BOULEVARD

ORANGE, NJ  07050-4117

in the amount of $274,537.85.

BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED that Certified Checks and/or Bid bonds of all except the lowest 

responsible bidder be forthwith returned, and the Mayor and Township Clerk be and they hereby are 

respectively authorized to execute and attest a contract for the foregoing. 

_______________________________ ___________________________________
KAREN CARNEVALE, R.M.C., MUNCIPAL CLERK MICHELLE CASALINO, COUNCIL PRESIDENT

I hereby certify funds are available from: ACCOUNT NO.
2019 Capital Budget 03 2584 19 0600 110
$119,995.24

_________________________________ 03 2584 19 0600 110                                                 

JOHN GROSS, CHIEF FINANCIAL OFFICER 2018 Capital Budget 03 2544 28 0400 040
$94,955.00
2017 Capital Budget 03 2526 17 0100 010
03 2526 17 0100 012; $17,103.50, $19,387.45
2010 Capital Budget 03 2229 22 0100 003
$12,100.00
2016 Capital Budget 03 2475 16 0040 010
$10,996.66



PLEASANT VALLEY WAY PARKING LOT RECONSTRUCTION
BID DATE – JUNE 9, 2020

1.  ZENITH CONSTRUCTION SERVICES, INC.
     365 Thomas Blvd.
     Orange, NJ  07050-4112

$274,537.85

2.  ADG CONTRACTING CORP.
     386 South Street, Suite 169
     Newark, NJ  07105

$291,614.00

3.  PICERNO GIORDANO
     200 Market Street
     Kenilworth, NJ  07033

$337,533.75

4.  KULPEKSA LAND IMPROVEMENT CORP.
     248 Franklin Ave.
     Rockaway, NJ  07866

$344,539.00

5.  LANDTEK CONSTRUCTION LLC
     386 Route 79
     Morganville, NJ  07751

$370,471.46

6.  FIVE STAR CONTRACTORS BUILDERS &
                  REMODELERS
     305 Cortland Street
     Belleville, NJ  07109

$399,509.78



129-20
June 23, 2020

RESOLUTION

WHEREAS, the Township of West Orange has advertised for bids, pursuant to the New Jersey 

Local Public Contracts Law (N.J.S.A. 40A:11-1) for the project Street Improvements, 2018, Phase IIA; and

WHEREAS, at the date time and place advertised for the opening of said bids, the Township did 

received seven bids; and 

WHEREAS, the Township Engineer reported that the successful bidder has strictly complied with

the bid specifications and is the lowest responsible bidder; and 

WHEREAS, the Township Council of the Township of West Orange has considered said bids and 

has further considered the recommendation of the Township Engineer as to the award of said bid.

NOW, THEREFORE BE IT RESOLVED by the Township Council of the Township of West Orange 

that the contract for the Project Street Improvements 2018, Phase IIA is hereby awarded to:

REGGIO CONSTRUCTION, INC.

416 EAST CENTRAL BOULEVARD

PALISADES PARK, NJ  07650

in the amount of $2,185,381.23.

BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED that Certified Checks and/or Bid bonds of all except the lowest 

responsible bidder be forthwith returned, and the Mayor and Township Clerk be and they hereby are 

respectively authorized to execute and attest a contract for the foregoing.

_______________________________ ___________________________________
KAREN CARNEVALE, R.M.C., MUNCIPAL CLERK MICHELLE CASALINO, COUNCIL PRESIDENT

I hereby certify funds are available from: ACCOUNT NO.
2019 Capital Budget
Street Resurfacing

_________________________________ 03 2584 19 0600 110
 JOHN GROSS, CHIEF FINANCIAL OFFICER                           $2,185,381.23



129-20

STREET IMPROVEMENT 2018 PHASE IIA
BID DATE – JUNE 9, 2020

1.  REGGIO CONSTRUCTION INC.
     416 E. Central Blvd
     Palisades Park, NJ  07650

$2,185,381.23

2.  CIFELLI & SON GENERAL CONSTRUCTION
     81 Franklin Ave.
     Nutley, NJ  07110

$2,346,104.20

3.  Your Way Construction
     404 Coit Street
     Irvington, NJ  07111

$2,496,188.20

4.  American Asphalt & Milling Services, LLC
     96 Midland Avenue
     Kearny, NJ  07032

$2,593,202.11

5.  DLS CONTRACTING
     36 Montesano Road
     Fairfield, NJ  07004

$2,628,871.00

6.  GRANDA CONSTRUCTION CORP.
     147 Thomas Street
     Newark, NJ  07114

$2,807,084.81

7.  BLACK ROCK ENTERPRISES LLC
     1316 Englishtown Road
     Old Bridge, NJ  08857

$2,990,059.60



130-20
June 23, 2020

RESOLUTION

WHEREAS, the Township of West Orange has advertised for bids, pursuant to the New Jersey Local 

Public Contracts Law (N.J.S.A. 40A:11-1) for the project Improvement of Old Indian Road, St. Cloud Avenue 

to North Edgewood Avenue; and

WHEREAS, at the date time and place advertised for the opening of said bids, the Township received

six bids; and

WHEREAS, the Township Engineer reported that the successful bidder has strictly complied with the

bid specifications and is the lowest responsible bidder; and

WHEREAS, the Township Council of the Township of West Orange has considered said bids and has

further considered the recommendation of the Township Engineer as to the award of said bid.

NOW, THEREFORE BE IT RESOLVED by the Township Council of the Township of West 

Orange that the contract for the Project Improvement of Old Indian Road, St. Cloud Avenue to North 

Edgewood Avenue, is hereby awarded to:

CIFELLI & SON GENERAL CONTRACTING, INC.

81 FRANKLIN AVENUE

NUTLEY, NJ  07110

in the amount of $712,677.00.

BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED that Certified Checks and/or Bid bonds of all except the lowest 

responsible bidder be forthwith returned, and the Mayor and Township Clerk be and they hereby are 

respectively authorized to execute and attest a contract for the foregoing.

                                                                                                                                                                                    
Karen J. Carnevale, R.M.C. Michelle Casalino, Council President
Municipal Clerk

I hereby certify funds are available from: ACCOUNT NO.
2019 Capital Budget
Street Resurfacing

                                                                                          03 2584 19 0600 110  $443,472.00
John O. Gross, Chief Financial Officer Various Escrow Accounts $269,205.00



130-20

IMPROVEMENT OF OLD INDIAN ROAD
ST. CLOUD AVENUE TO NORTH EDGEWOOD AVENUE

BID DATE – JUNE 9, 2020

1.  CIFELLI & SON GENERAL CONTRACTING, INC.
     81 Franklin Ave.
     Nutley, NJ  07110

$712,677.00

2.  ADG CONTRACTING CORP.
     386 South Street #169
     Newark, NJ  07105

$779,884.00

3.  GRABOWSKI CONSTRUCTION, INC.
     770 Northfield Avenue
     West Orange, NJ  07052

$788,643.00

4.  A. TAKTON CONCRETE CORP.
     13 Toce Avenue
     South River, N.J.  08882

$836,149.75

5.  BLACK ROCK ENTERPRISES LLC
     1316 Englishtown Road
     Old Bridge, NJ  08857

$920,025.50

6.  American Asphalt & Milling Services LLC
     96 Midland Avenue
     Kearny, NJ  07032

$1,001,707.44



131-20
June 23, 2020

RESOLUTION

WHEREAS, the Township of West Orange (the “Township”) is committed to improving

the safety and lives of its residents; and

WHEREAS, the Township’s Police Department (“WOPD”) has received inquiries

regarding its approach to several important and impactful policies, as set forth on

www.8cantwait.org, a project by Campaign Zero (“8CantWait”); and

WHEREAS, 8CantWait sets forth eight (8) policies that reduce the potential harm

caused by law enforcement, which include the following: (i) ban chokeholds & strangleholds; (ii)

require de-escalation; (iii); require warning before shooting; (iv) exhaust all other means before

shooting; (v) duty to intervene; (vi) ban shooting at moving vehicles; (vii) require use of force

continuum; and (viii) require comprehensive reporting; and

WHEREAS, on June 4, 2020, the WOPD posted a statement on the Township’s website

noting that the Township currently has in place all eight policies and procedures of 8CantWait

and performs consistent with these trainings; and 

WHEREAS, the Mayor requests that the Township Council affirm its commitment to

support the WOPD in its efforts and full compliance with all eight policies set forth in

8CantWait;

NOW THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED BY THE TOWNSHIP COUNCIL OF

THE TOWNSHIP OF WEST ORANGE, that the Township hereby affirms its commitment

that the West Orange Police Department continue to fully comply with all eight policies set forth

in 8CantWait; and be it further



2

4843-8829-6127, v. 2

RESOLVED, that a copy of this Resolution shall be made available in the Clerk’s office

in accordance with applicable law.

                                                                                                                                                            
Karen J. Carnevale, R.M.C. Michelle Casalino
Township Clerk Council President

Adopted: June 23, 2020



132-20
June 23, 2020

RESOLUTION

WHEREAS, the Township of West Orange (the “Township”) is committed to increasing

the number of women and minorities in the Township’s Police Department (“WOPD”); and

WHEREAS, the State of New Jersey has establish an Alternate Route Program (“ARP”)

designed to give individuals interested in becoming police officers, the opportunity to attend a

certified police training academy at their own expense, prior to being hired by a police, sheriff,

or campus police department in accordance with the provisions of N.J.S.A. 52:17B-69.1; and

WHEREAS, the ARP does not guarantee a candidate a position in law enforcement, it is

often utilized by municipalities to hire additional officers; and

WHEREAS, the New Jersey Civil Service Commission has imposed restrictions on the

ARP whereby Civil Service Communities, like the Township, are not permitted to hire from the

Alternate Route Training Program; and

WHEREAS, the Township would benefit greatly from hiring graduates of ARP,

especially as a way to increase the number of minorities and women within its department; and

WHEREAS, the Mayor requests that the Township Council urge the State of New Jersey

to permit all civil service communities to hire directly from the Alternate Route Program;

NOW THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED BY THE TOWNSHIP COUNCIL OF

THE TOWNSHIP OF WEST ORANGE, that the Township hereby urges the Governor of the

State of New Jersey to permit all civil service communities to hire directly from the Alternate

Route Program; and



2

4847-4484-0384, v. 1

RESOLVED, that a copy of this Resolution shall be forwarded to the Governor of New

Jersey, New Jersey Senate President, New Jersey Assembly Speaker, and all Legislators who

represent the Township; and

RESOLVED, that a copy of this Resolution shall be made available in the Clerk’s office

in accordance with applicable law.

                                                                                                                                                            
Karen J. Carnevale, R.M.C Michelle Casalino
Municipal Clerk Council President

Adopted:  June 23, 2020



133-20
June 23, 2020

RESOLUTION

WHEREAS, pursuant to N.J.S.A. 2B:19-6(a), municipalities are authorized to enter into

contracts with private collection agencies or firms for the collection of outstanding municipal

court debt; and

WHEREAS, pursuant to Resolution No. 142-15, the Township entered into an

agreement with TaxServ Capital Services N.J., LLC (“TaxServ”) for the private collection of

municipal court debt (collectively, the “Agreement”), pursuant to a Competitive Contracting

process which was approved by the Administrative Office of the Courts (“AOC”); and

WHEREAS, the Agreement provided that the Agreement would be for a term of three

(3) years, with an option to extend it for two additional one (1) year extensions; and

 WHEREAS, the Agreement is scheduled to expire on July 1, 2020 after the Township

had exercised the two one (1) year extensions; and 

WHEREAS, due to the partial closure of the Township due to the COVID-19 virus state

of emergency and public health emergency, the Township has been unable to commence a new

procurement process for a new contract for private collection of outstanding municipal court

debt; and

WHEREAS, the Township seeks to extend the Agreement for an additional ninety (90)

days to allow TaxServ to continue to perform its duties under the Agreement at no cost to the

Township.

NOW, BE IT HEREBY RESOLVED BY THE TOWNSHIP COUNCIL OF THE

TOWNSHIP OF WEST ORANGE that the Mayor and Township Clerk are hereby authorized

to execute and attest to, respectively, the Ninety Day Contract Extension annexed hereto as



4850-1748-6784, v. 1

Exhibit “A,” between the Township of West Orange and TaxServ, for the Collection of

Outstanding Municipal Court Debt (the “Contract Extension”); and it is further

RESOLVED, that the original of the Contract Extension between the Township and

TaxServ shall be maintained in the Municipal Clerk’s office.

                                                                                                                                                            
Karen J. Carnevale, R.M.C Michelle Casalino
Municipal Clerk Council President

Adopted:  June 23, 2020
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NINETY (90) DAY CONTRACT EXTENSION FOR THE 

CONTRACT FOR PRIVATE COLLECTION OF
OUTSTANDING MUNICIPAL COURT DEBT

THIS AGREEMENT EXTENSION, effective on the 1st day of July 2020, is by and

between the TOWNSHIP OF WEST ORANGE, a municipal corporation of the State of New

Jersey, having its principal offices at 66 Main Street, West Orange, New Jersey, hereinafter

referred to as “Township,” and TAXSERV CAPITAL SERVICES NJ, LLC a limited liability

company of the Commonwealth of Virginia having its principal offices at 1313 Dolly Madison

Boulevard, Suite LL-130, McLean, Virginia 22101-3926, hereinafter referred to as “Contractor.”

W I T N E S S E T H:

WHEREAS, pursuant to N.J.S.A. 2B:19-6(a), the Township is authorized to enter into

contracts with a private collection agency or firm for the collection of outstanding municipal

court debt; and

WHEREAS, pursuant to a competitive contracting process and Resolution No. 142-15,

the Township entered into an agreement with Contractor for the private collection of municipal

court debt (collectively, the “Agreement”), which Agreement became effective on July 1, 2015;

and

WHEREAS, the Agreement provided that the Agreement would be for a term of three

(3) years, with an option to extend the Agreement for two (2) additional one-year extensions; and

NOW THEREFORE, in consideration of the foregoing and of the mutual covenants

hereinafter stated, the parties do hereby agree as follows:  

1. The Township and Contractor agree to extend the term of the Agreement for a

limited additional term of ninety (90) days.

2. The Commencement Date of this extension shall be deemed as of July 1, 2020,



2

4817-6441-0816, v. 1

3. All other terms of the Agreement shall remain valid and binding.

ATTEST:        TOWNSHIP OF WEST ORANGE

______________________________                     BY: _______________________________
KAREN CARNEVALE,                                                   ROBERT D. PARISI,
MUNICIPAL CLERK                       MAYOR

ATTEST:        TAXSERV CAPITAL SERVICES NJ, LLC

______________________________           BY: ______________________________
NAME:       ROGER BLAIN,

      SENIOR VICE PRESIDENT



134-20
June 23, 2020

R E S O L U T I O N

WHEREAS, the Township of West Orange requested proposals from five (5) architectural firms

to provide professional services for Architectural and Engineering Services for improvements to Fire

Station No. 1, Fire Station No. 3, Fire Station No. 4 and Fire Station No. 5; and

WHEREAS, the services of an architectural firm are required to provide the necessary

professional design services for architectural and mechanical, electrical and plumbing improvements of

these four fire stations; and

WHEREAS, Herbst Musciano of Boonton, New Jersey and Arcari & Iovino of Little Ferry, New

Jersey responded to the Request for Proposal; and

WHEREAS, both firms were responsive to the Township’s Request for Qualifications; and

WHEREAS, Herbst Musciano, of Boonton, New Jersey submitted a proposal dated March 2, 2020

to provide professional services for Architectural Services and Engineering Services for four Fire Stations,

No. 1, No. 3, No. 4 and No. 5 for a fee not to exceed $93,653.00; and

WHEREAS, the fee proposal of Herbst Musciano was less than the fee proposal of Arcari &

Iovino which was $103,230.00; and 

WHEREAS, the proposal of Herbst Musciano is acceptable to the Municipal Engineer; and

WHEREAS, sufficient funds exist for this work; and

WHEREAS, the Township Council concurs in the foregoing.

NOW THEREFORE BE IT RESOLVED, by the Township Council of the Township of West Orange

that the Township be and hereby authorized to enter into a Professional Services Contract with Herbst

Musciano, 611 Main Street Second Floor, Boonton, New Jersey 07005 to provide Professional



Architectural and Engineering Services for Fire Station No. 1, Fire Station No. 3, Fire Station No. 4 and

Fire Station No. 5 in accordance with their proposal dated March 2, 2020.

BE IT FURTHR RESOLVED that a copy of this Resolution be published in the West Orange

Chronicle within 10 days of approval in accordance with N.J.S.A. 40A:11-5(1) (a)(i).

                                                                                                                                                                                    
Karen J. Carnevale, R.M.C., Municipal Clerk Michelle Casalino, Council President

Adopted: June 23, 2020

I hereby certify funds are available from ACCOUNT NO. 03 2507 17 0100 010      $88,749.95
                                                                                                      03 2507 17 0100 020      $  4,903.05

                                                                                          
John O. Gross, Chief Financial Officer







From: Andrea Zeligman
Sent: Wednesday, June 17, 2020 2:20 PM
To: Karen Carnevale; Jack Sayers; John Gross; kenkayser@verizon.net; 
GMusciano@HerbstMusciano.com
Cc: Leonard Lepore; Andrea Zeligman
Subject: Professional Design Services Architectural and Engineering Services Fire Stations No. 
1,No. 3, No. 4 and No. 5 
Attachments: Proposals  Professional Design Services Architectural &  Eng. Services Fire Stations No. 1, 
3, 4 &5.pdf; Resolution Fire Houses - Professional Design Services Herbst Musciano.docx; RFP Fire 
Houses February 2020.pdf; Proposal, Arcari, Iovino Fire Houses March 2020.pdf; Proposal, Arcari, Iovino 
Fire Houses April 2020.pdf

Please see attached.

Thanks,

Andrea 

Andrea Zeligman
Keyboarding Clerk 
Department of Public Works/ Engineering Division
25 Lakeside Avenue
West Orange. NJ 07052
Phone:  (973) 325-4160
Fax:     (973) 669-9588
engineering@westorange.org
www.westorange.org

? Please consider the environment before you print this email 
America, Land of the Free, Because of the Brave!  C

Confidentiality Notice: This e-mail contains information from theTownship of West Orange.  It is intended only for the person or entity to which it is 
addressed and may contain information that is privileged, confidential or otherwise protected from disclosure. Dissemination, distribution or copying 
of 
this e-mail or the information contained within it by anyone other than the intended recipient or an employee or agent responsible for delivering the 
message to the intended recipient is prohibited. If you have received this e-mail in error, please call 973-325-4100 and destroy the original message
and 
all copies.  
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June 23, 2020

RESOLUTION

WHEREAS, the Township of West Orange has advertised for bids, pursuant to the New Jersey Local 
Public Contracts Law (N.J.S.A. 40A:11-1) for the Installation of Emergency Generators at Fire Station 
No.2, Fire Station No.3, and the Municipal Building; and

WHEREAS, at the date time and place advertised for the opening of said bids, the Township received 
seven bids; and

WHEREAS, the Township Engineer reported that the successful bidder has strictly complied with the bid
specifications and is the lowest responsible bidder; and 

WHEREAS, the Township Council of the Township of West Orange has considered said bids and has 
further considered the recommendation of the Township Engineer as to the award of said bid.

NOW, THEREFORE BE IT RESOLVED by the Township Council of the Township of West Orange 
that the contract for the Installation of Emergency Electrical Generators, Base Bid, Fire Station No. 2 and 
Alternate Bid No. 1, Fire Station No.3 is hereby awarded to:

D & M ELECTRICAL, LLC
3 BORREGO DRIVE

WOODLAND PARK, N.J. 07424
in the amount of $73,000.00.

BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED That the Township Engineer is authorized to rebid the 
installation of the Emergency Generator for the Municipal Building, after reducing the scope of the 
project and the costs associated thereof; and

BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED that Certified Checks and/or Bid bonds of all except the lowest 
responsible bidder be forthwith returned, and the Mayor and Township Clerk be and they hereby are 
respectively authorized to execute and attest a contract for the foregoing.

                                                                                                                                                                        
Karen J. Carnevale, R.M.C., Municipal Clerk Michelle Casalino, Council President

Adopted: June 23, 2020

I hereby certify funds are available from. ACCOUNT NO.
01 2040 41 2240 214
Grant Reserves, Hazard Mitigation $45,797.61
03 2407 14 0020 060

                                                                      2014 Capital Budget
John O. Gross, Chief Financial Officer Indoor Facilities $27,202.39
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BID DATE: June 16th, 2020

EMERGENCY GENERATORS INSTALLATION

1. Mike Spagnuolo Electrical Contractor Base Bid:       $82,990.00
Mike Spagnuolo Alternate Bid 1:    $123,850.00
69 Oakridge Road Alternate Bid 2:    $116,830.00
West Orange, NJ  07052 Alternate Bid 2A:  $103,980.00
973-325-6812 - Tel
206-378-2709
msec@mikeywirs.com

2. Astro Electrical Contractor, LLC Base Bid:       $58,000.00
Walter H. Paz Alternate Bid 1:       $74,000.00
1415 E. Elizabeth Ave. Alternate Bid 2:      $138,000.00
Linden, NJ  07036 Alternate Bid 2A:   $127,000.00
908-925-2113 - Tel
908-925-2115 – Fax
dpastro20@gmail.com

3. Multi-Phase Electrical Services, Inc. Base Bid:        $92,050.00
Matthew Deli Alternate Bid 1:      $118,700.00
15 William Street Alternate Bid 2:      $166,800.00
Closter, NJ  07624 Alternate Bid 2A:   $159,050.00
201-207-7870 – Tel
201- 297-7866 - Fax
mdell@mpesinc.com

4. A C I Electrical Contractor Inc. NO BID
Anthony Infantolino
548 Oldwoods Road
Wyckoff, NJ  07481
201-522-6026 – Tel
Does not have a fax number
Anthony@ACIelectrical.com

5. Advanced Control Systems Base Bid:      $51,153.25
John Baldassarre Alternate Bid 1:      $51,153.25
12 Champions Way Alternate Bid 2:    $119,306.50
Manalapan, NJ   07726 Alternate Bid 2A: $102,306.50
732-234-3232 – Tel
Has no fax number
johnb@ACScompany.net

mailto:msec@mikeywirs.com
mailto:mdell@mpesinc.com
mailto:Anthony@ACIelectrical.com
mailto:johnb@ACScompany.net


6. Dodge Data & Analytics NO BID
Kate Vozza
4300 Beltway Pl, Ste. 150
Arlington, TX  76018
609-336-2636 - Tel
609-336-5911 – Fax
dodge.docs@construction.com

7. Manor II Electric, INC Base Bid:                  $80,000.00
Alex Haile Alternate Bid 1:      $84,000.00
3 Ardsley Court Alternate Bid 2:    $132,000.00
Holmdel, N.J. 07733 Alternate Bid 2A:  $122,000.00
973-465-5040 – Tel
973-465-5570 – Fax
manorII@optimum.net

8. Vanore Electric Inc. NO BID
John or Brian
238 High Street
Hackensack, NJ 07601
973-897-1172 – Tel
201-342-1452 – Fax
Brian@vanore-electric.com

9. Matt Jackowitz NO BID
500 West Main Street, suite #4
Wyckoff, NJ 07481
201-485-7353 – Tel
775-576-9657 – Fax
Matt.Jackowitz@EastAlliance.com

10. CFM Construction, INC NO BID
Carmine Coscia
5 Bay Street
Stirling, NJ 07980
908-903-9477 – Tel
908-903-9478 – Fax
carminecoscia@cfmconstruction.com

11. D & M Electrical LLC Base Bid:               $40,000.00
Zoranco Bozinov Alternate Bid 1:   $33,000.00
3 Borrego Drive Alternate Bid 2:   $92,630.00
Woodland Park, N.J. 07424 Alternate Bid 2A: $82,000.00
862-262-8487 – Tel
973-435-7498 – Fax

mailto:dodge.docs@construction.com
mailto:manorII@optimum.net
mailto:Brian@vanore-electric.com
mailto:Matt.Jackowitz@EastAlliance.com
mailto:carminecoscia@cfmconstruction.com


admin@dmelectricalllc.com

12. Power With Prestige Inc. Base Bid:    $62,000.00
Joseph P. Carroll II Alternate Bid 1:    $70,000.00
40 Swartswood Road Alternate Bid 2:    $117,000.00
Newton, NJ  07860 Alternate Bid 2A: $107,000.00
973 978-4018 - Tel
973-940-1994 – Fax
joe@pwpinc.biz

mailto:admin@dmelectricalllc.com
mailto:joe@pwpinc.biz


136-20
June 23, 2020

RESOLUTION

WHEREAS, on October 13, 2010, a mortgage was filed by the Township under the

West Orange Housing Rehabilitation Program, recorded on February 15, 2011, against Gary Van Wyk 

and Lisa Brittan (the “Owners”) who own 71 Burnett Terrace in the Township of West Orange known as 

Block 45 Lot 24 (the “Property”); and

WHEREAS, the mortgage was in the amount of $ 22,000 payable whenever this

property was sold or the title transferred; and

WHEREAS, the Owner has indicated that they have repaid the entire amount of the

mortgage on or about June 18, 2020; and

WHEREAS, the Department of Planning and Development has reviewed their files and

found that the mortgage filed against the Property in the amount of $22,000 has been paid in

full;

NOW, BE IT RESOLVED THAT the Mayor be and is hereby authorized to execute a

Discharge of Mortgage, attached hereto as Exhibit “A”, with regard to the Property and Owner; and be it 

further

RESOLVED THAT the Municipal Clerk be and is hereby authorized to attest

to the Mayor’s signature on the Discharge of Mortgage concerning the Property; and be it

further

RESOLVED THAT a copy of the Resolution shall be made available in the Clerk’s

office in accordance with applicable law.

                                                                                                                                                                        
Karen Carnevale, R.M.C.                              Michele Casalino
Municipal Clerk Council President

Adopted: June 23, 2020
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BOND ORDINANCE PROVIDING FOR THE LOCAL
UNIT’S ALLOCABLE SHARE OF THE FLOOD
MITIGATION FACILITIES PROJECT OF THE JOINT
MEETING OF ESSEX AND UNION COUNTIES, BY AND IN
THE TOWNSHIP OF WEST ORANGE, IN THE COUNTY
OF ESSEX, STATE OF NEW JERSEY (THE “LOCAL
UNIT”); APPROPRIATING $3,170,000 THEREFOR AND
AUTHORIZING THE ISSUANCE OF $3,170,000 BONDS
OR NOTES TO FINANCE THE COST THEREOF

BE IT ORDAINED AND ENACTED BY THE GOVERNING BODY OF THE

TOWNSHIP OF WEST ORANGE, IN THE COUNTY OF ESSEX, STATE OF NEW

JERSEY (not less than two-thirds of all the members thereof affirmatively concurring),

AS FOLLOWS:

SECTION 1. The improvements described in Section 3 of this bond

ordinance are hereby authorized to be undertaken by the Joint Meeting of Essex and

Union Counties (the “Joint Meeting”) on behalf of the Township of West Orange, in the

County of Essex, State of New Jersey (the "Local Unit") as general improvements. For

the said improvements stated in Section 3, there is hereby appropriated the aggregate

sum of $3,170,000. Pursuant to the provisions of N.J.S.A. 40A:2-11(c) of the Local

Bond Law, N.J.S.A. 40A:2-1 et seq., as amended and supplemented (the “Local Bond

Law”), no down payment is required as this bond ordinance authorizes obligations for

environmental infrastructure projects which are funded by loans from the New Jersey

Infrastructure Bank (the “I-Bank”) and the State of New Jersey, acting by or through the

Department of Environmental Protection.

SECTION 2. For the financing of said improvements or purposes

described in Section 3 hereof and to meet the $3,170,000 appropriation, negotiable
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bonds of the Local Unit are hereby authorized to be issued in the principal amount of

$3,170,000 pursuant to, and within all limitations prescribed by, the Local Bond Law. In

anticipation of the issuance of said bonds and to temporarily finance said improvements

or purposes, negotiable notes of the Local Unit in a principal amount not exceeding

$3,170,000 are hereby authorized to be issued pursuant to, and within the limitations

prescribed by, said Local Bond Law.

SECTION 3. The improvements hereby authorized and purposes for the

financing of which said debt obligations are to be issued are for the Local Unit’s

allocable share of capital improvement projects being undertaken by the Joint Meeting,

including, as applicable, but not limited to, (a) Phase I of the Flood Mitigation Facilities

Project consisting of the construction of an Effluent Pumping Station, which will be

connected to the existing twin outfall channels to the Arthur Kill, and (b) Phase II of the

Flood Mitigation Facilities Project consisting of upgrades to the Co-Generation Facility,

which upgrades include, but are not limited to, as applicable, the installation of two (2)

additional co-generation engines in the existing Co-Generation Facility, the installation

of electrical and instrumentation equipment for the new generator engines, integration of

the new engines into the existing Co-Generation Facility, connection of the Biosolids

Facilities to the Co-Generation electrical transmission lines, and upgrades to the

substations at the Biosolids Facilities.

a. All improvements shall include, as applicable, all work,

materials, equipment, engineering services and design, architectural services and

designs, surveying, environmental consulting work, environmental remediation,

preparation of plans and specifications, governmental permits, bid documents, conducting
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and preparation of reports, plans, analysis, and studies, equipment rental, labor and

appurtenances necessary therefore or incidental thereto.

b. The aggregate estimated maximum amount of bonds or notes

to be issued for said improvements or purposes is $3,170,000.

c. The aggregate estimated cost of said improvements or

purposes is $3,170,000.

SECTION 4. In the event the United States of America, the State of New

Jersey, and/or the County of Essex make a loan, contribution or grant-in-aid to the Local

Unit for the improvements authorized hereby and the same shall be received by the

Local Unit prior to the issuance of the bonds or notes authorized in Section 2 hereof,

then the amount of such bonds or notes to be issued shall be reduced by the amount so

received from the United States of America, the State of New Jersey, and/or the County

of Essex. In the event, however, that any amount so loaned, contributed or granted by

the United States of America, the State of New Jersey, and/or the County of Essex shall

be received by the Local Unit after the issuance of the bonds or notes authorized in

Section 2 hereof, then such funds shall be applied to the payment of the bonds or notes

so issued and shall be used for no other purpose. This Section 4 shall not apply

however, with respect to any contribution or grant in aid received by the Local Unit as a

result of using such funds from this bond ordinance as “matching local funds” to receive

such contribution or grant in aid.

SECTION 5. All bond anticipation notes issued hereunder shall mature at

such times as may be determined by the Chief Financial Officer of the Local Unit,

provided that no bond anticipation note shall mature later than one (1) year from its
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date, unless such bond anticipation notes are permitted to mature at such later date in

accordance with the provisions of the New Jersey Infrastructure Trust Act, N.J.S.A.

58:11B-1 (“NJIT Act”). The bond anticipation notes shall bear interest at such rate or

rates and be in such form as may be determined by the Chief Financial Officer. The

Chief Financial Officer of the Local Unit shall determine all matters in connection with

the bond anticipation notes issued pursuant to this bond ordinance, and the signature of

the Chief Financial Officer upon the bond anticipation notes shall be conclusive

evidence as to all such determinations. All bond anticipation notes issued hereunder

may be renewed from time to time in accordance with the provisions of Section 8.1 of

the Local Bond Law and, as applicable, the provisions of the NJIT Act. The Chief

Financial Officer is hereby authorized to sell part or all of the bond anticipation notes

from time to time at public or private sale and to deliver them to the purchaser thereof

upon receipt of payment of the purchase price and accrued interest thereon from their

dates to the date of delivery thereof. The Chief Financial officer is directed to report in

writing to the governing body at the meeting next succeeding the date when any sale or

delivery of the bond anticipation notes pursuant to this bond ordinance is made. Such

report must include the principal amount, the description, the interest rate, and the

maturity schedule of the bond anticipation notes so sold, the price obtained and the

name of the purchaser.

SECTION 6. The Local Unit hereby certifies that it has adopted a capital

budget or a temporary capital budget, as applicable. The capital or temporary capital

budget of the Local Unit is hereby amended to conform with the provisions of this bond

ordinance to the extent of any inconsistency herewith. To the extent that the purposes
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authorized herein are inconsistent with the adopted capital or temporary capital budget,

a revised capital or temporary capital budget has been filed with the Division of Local

Government Services.

SECTION 7. The following additional matters are hereby determined,

declared, recited and stated:

a. The purposes described in Section 3 of this bond ordinance are

not current expenses and are improvements which the Local Unit may lawfully

undertake as general improvements, and no part of the cost thereof has been or shall

be specially assessed on property specially benefited thereby.

b. The average period of usefulness of said improvements or

purposes within the limitations of said Local Bond Law, according to the reasonable life

thereof computed from the date of the said bonds authorized by this bond ordinance, is 30

years.

c. The supplemental debt statement required by the Local Bond

Law has been duly made and filed in the Office of the Clerk of the Local Unit and a

complete executed duplicate thereof has been filed in the Office of the Director of the

Division of Local Government Services within the Department of Community Affairs of

the State of New Jersey, and such statement shows that the gross debt of the Local

Unit, as defined in the Local Bond Law, is increased by the authorization of the bonds

and notes provided for in this bond ordinance by $3,170,000 and the said obligations

authorized by this bond ordinance will be within all debt limitations prescribed by said

Local Bond Law.

d. An aggregate amount not exceeding $816,392 for items of
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expense listed in and permitted under section 20 of the Local Bond Law is included in

the estimated cost indicated herein for the improvements hereinbefore described.

[e. This bond ordinance authorizes obligations of the Local Unit

solely for purposes described in N.J.S.A. 40A:2-7(h). The obligations authorized herein

are to be issued for purposes that are deemed to be self-liquidating pursuant to N.J.S.A.

40A:2-47(a) and are deductible from gross debt pursuant to N.J.S.A. 40A:2-44(c).]

[e.][f.] In accordance with N.J.S.A. 40:63-134, bonds authorized

and issued by the Local Unit to finance improvements or works for the Joint Meeting

shall not be taken to be included within or governed by any limitation fixed by law to the

amount of bonds authorized to be issued by the Local Unit.

SECTION 8. The full faith and credit of the Local Unit are hereby pledged

to the punctual payment of the principal of and the interest on the debt obligations

authorized by this bond ordinance. The debt obligations shall be direct, unlimited

obligations of the Local Unit, and the Local Unit shall be obligated to levy ad valorem

taxes upon all the taxable property located within the Local Unit for the payment of the

principal of and the interest thereon without limitation as to rate or amount.

SECTION 9. The Local Unit reasonably expects to reimburse any

expenditures toward the costs of the improvements or purposes described in Section 3

hereof and paid prior to the issuance of any bonds or notes authorized by this bond

ordinance with the proceeds of such bonds or notes. This Section 9 is intended to be

and hereby is a declaration of the Local Unit's official intent to reimburse any

expenditure toward the costs of the improvements or purposes described in Section 3

hereof to be incurred and paid prior to the issuance of bonds or notes authorized herein
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in accordance with Treasury Regulations Section 150-2.

SECTION 10. The Local Unit covenants to maintain the exclusion from

gross income under section 103(a) of the Internal Revenue Code of 1986, as amended,

of the interest on all bonds and notes issued under this ordinance.

SECTION 11. Upon adoption hereof, the Clerk of the Local Unit shall

forward certified copies of this bond ordinance to Everett M. Johnson, Esq., Wilentz,

Goldman & Spitzer, P.A., bond counsel to the Joint Meeting of Essex and Union Counties,

and Richard T. Nolan, Esq., McCarter & English, LLP, bond counsel to the I-Bank.

SECTION 12. This bond ordinance shall take effect twenty (20) days after

the first publication hereof after final adoption, as provided by the Local Bond Law.

ADOPTED ON FIRST READING

DATED:  June, 9, 2020

_________________________
Karen J. Carnevale, Clerk

ADOPTED ON SECOND READING

DATED: June 23, 2020

___________________________
Karen J. Carnevale, Clerk

APPROVAL BY THE MAYOR ON THIS 23rd DAY OF June 23, 2020

_______________________________
ROBERT D. PARISI, MAYOR
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AN ORDINANCE RELEASING, EXTINGUISHING AND VACATING THE
RIGHTS OF A 25’ WIDE UTILITY EASEMENT LOCATED IN COLONIAL
WOODS NORTH MAJOR SUBDIVISION SHOWN ON FILED MAP #4518
FILED IN THE ESSEX COUNTY REGISTERS OFFICE ON JULY 30, 2007

RUNNING ALONG THE REAR OF LOTS 12.23, 12.24, 12.25, 12.26 AND 12.27 IN
BLOCK 173, TOWNSHIP OF WEST ORANGE, COUNTY OF ESSEX AND 

STATE OF NEW JERSEY

An ordinance releasing, extinguishing and vacating the 25-foot-wide-utility
easement located along the rear of lots 12.23, 12.24, 12.25, 12.26 and 12.27 in Block 173
on the Tax Map of the Township of West Orange, Essex County, N.J., which became of
record as part of the “Colonial Woods North Major Subdivision Plat,” dated January 18,
2007 and filed in the Essex County Registers Office on July 30, 2007 as Map 4518 (the
“Property”).

WHEREAS, RNC Developers, Inc. (“RNC”) is the owner of property on the
Colonial Woods Drive extension in the Township of West Orange (“Township”); and

WHEREAS, there exists a 25-foot-wide Utility Easement presently encumbering
the rear of Lots 12.23, 12.24, 12.25, 12.25 and 12.27 in Block 173 on the Colonial Woods
Drive extension (“Easement”); and

WHEREAS, the purpose of the Easement was to contain certain sanitary sewer
lines and storm drain lines in that Easement area; and

WHEREAS, the aforementioned utilities have been eliminated with
modifications to the utilities within the street right-of-way; and

WHEREAS, the Township’s Engineer has determined that the Easement is of no
use to the Township; and

WHEREAS, it has been determined by the Township Council, after due
investigation and consideration as follows:

(1) that the 25-foot-wide utility easement described hereinbelow is no longer
necessary because the utilities were relocated into the street right-of-way;
and

(2) that it is in the best interest of the general public and the Township of
West Orange that any public easements, right and interest in and to same
shall be vacated, released and extinguished;

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT HEREBY ORDERED by the Township Council
of the Township of West Orange, County of Essex, and State of New Jersey as follows:
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SECTION I

All public easements, rights and interests to the 25’ wide utility easement running
along the rear of lots 12.23, 12.24, 12.25, 12.26 and 12.27 in Block 173 on the Tax Map
of the Township of West Orange, Essex County, N.J., which became of record as part of
the “Colonial Woods North Major Subdivision Plat,” filed in the Essex County Registers
Office on July 30, 2007 as Map 4518, described herein and attached hereto as Exhibit A,
are hereby vacated, released and extinguished except for said easements and rights
specifically set forth in the description hereinbelow:

DESCRIPTION OF 25’ WIDE UTILITY EASEMENT RUNNING ALONG THE
REAR OF LOTS 12.23, 12.24, 12.25, 12.26 AND 12.27 IN BLOCK 173 TOWNSHIP

OF WEST ORANGE ESSEX COUNTY, NEW JERSEY

BEGINNING at a point on the Easterly sideline of Nance Road Extension (50’wide) said
point also being on the Northerly line of Public Service Electric and Gas Row (150’ 
wide) said point is located on the Southerly outside tract line of Colonial Woods North 
Major Subdivision, said Major Subdivision was prepared by GC Stewart Associates 
Dated January 18, 2007 and filed in the Essex County Registers office on July 30, 2007 
as map No. 4518.

Thence (1) running along said Southerly outside tract line of Colonial Woods North 
Major Subdivision and Northerly sideline of PSE&G ROW and rear lot line of lots 12.23,
12.24, 12.25, 12.26 and 12.27   South 71 degrees 54 minutes 50 seconds East, 495.54  
feet to a point on the Westerly end of a 18’ wide utility easement partially located on Lot 
12.23.

Thence (2) along said Westerly edge of said 18’ wide utility easement North 18 degrees 
05 minutes 10 seconds East, 25.00 feet to the Northerly side of said 25’ wide utility 
easement. 

Thence (3) running along said Northerly line of 25’ utility easement and along the rear of 
lots 12.23, 12.24, 12.25, 12.26 and 12.27 North 71 degrees 54 minutes 50 seconds West, 
514.95 feet to the aforesaid Easterly sideline of Nance Road Extension.

Thence (4) running along the Easterly Sideline of Nance Road Extension on a curve 
curving to the left having a radius of 75’ a central angle of 19 degrees 33 minutes 25 
seconds a length of 25.60 a chord bearing of South 17 degrees 48 minutes 59 seconds 
East 25.48’ to a point;

Thence (5) still along same, South 27 degrees 35 minutes 42 seconds East 6.25 feet to the
POINT AND PLACE OF BEGINNING.
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SECTION II

Specifically reserved and excepted from the vacation which is described in
Section I above are all rights and privileges now possessed by public utilities, as defined
in N.J.S.A. 48:2-13, for existing overhead lines and underground telephone lines and any
other utilities that are in, adjacent to, over or under the street, and by any Cable
Television Company, as defined in the “Cable Television Act”, N.J.S.A. 48:5A-1 et   seq.,
to maintain, repair and replace their existing facilities in, adjacent to, over or under the
street, or any part thereof.

SECTION III

The Township Clerk shall, within sixty (60) days after the effective date of this
Ordinance, file a copy of the within Ordinance, certified by her, under the seal of the
Township of West Orange, to be a true copy, together with proof of publication, in the
Office of the Register of Deeds of the County of Essex, all in accordance with N.J.S.A.
40:67-21.

SECTION IV

Any and all Ordinances or parts of Ordinances inconsistent with the provisions of
this Ordinance are hereby repealed to the extent of such inconsistency.

SECTION V

This Ordinance shall take effect immediately upon adoption and publication in
accordance with law.

                                                                                                                                  
Karen J. Carnevale, R.M.C. Mayor Robert D. Parisi

                                                                 
Michelle Casalino, Council President

Introduced : June 9, 2020

Adopted : June 23, 2020
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Legislative History

This Ordinance vacates the utility easement depicted on the Map annexed hereto
as Exhibit “A”.  The purpose of the Easement was to contain certain sanitary sewer lines
and storm drain lines in that Easement area.  The Easement is no longer necessary
because the utilities have been eliminated with modifications to the utilities within the
street right-of-way.



EXHIBIT “A” 





 
 
 
 
 

DESCRIPTION OF A 25’ WIDE UTILITY EASEMENT  
TO BE VACATED 

LOCATED IN COLONIAL WOODS NORTH MAJOR SUBDIVISION 
SHOWN ON FILED MAP #4518 FILED IN THE ESSEX COUNTY REGISTERS 

OFFICE ON JULY 30, 2007  
RUNNING ALONG THE REAR OF LOTS 12.23, 12.24, 12.25, 12.26 AND 12.27 IN 

BLOCK 173 
TOWNSHIP OF WEST ORANGE, STATE OF NEW JERSEY 

BEING FURTHER DESCRIBED AS FOLLOWS  
 
 
BEGINNING at a point on the Easterly sideline of Nance Road Extension (50’wide) said 
point also being on the Northerly line of Public Service Electric and Gas Row (150’ 
wide) said point is located on the Southerly outside tract line of Colonial Woods North 
Major Subdivision, said Major Subdivision was prepared by GC Stewart Associates 
Dated January 18, 2007 and filed in the Essex County Registers office on July 30, 2007 
as map No. 4518. 
 
Thence (1) running along said Southerly outside tract line of Colonial Woods North 
Major Subdivision and Northerly sideline of PSE&G ROW and rear lot line of lots 12.23, 
12.24, 12.25, 12.26 and 12.27   South 71 degrees 54 minutes 50 seconds East, 495.54  
feet to a point on the Westerly end of a 18’ wide utility easement partially located on Lot 
12.23. 
 
Thence (2) along said Westerly edge of said 18’ wide utility easement North 18 degrees 
05 minutes 10 seconds East, 25.00 feet to the Northerly side of said 25’ wide utility 
easement.  
 
Thence (3) running along said Northerly line of 25’ utility easement and along the rear of 
lots 12.23, 12.24, 12.25, 12.26 and 12.27 North 71 degrees 54 minutes 50 seconds West, 
514.95 feet to the aforesaid Easterly sideline of Nance Road Extension.  
 
Thence (4) running along the Easterly Sideline of Nance Road Extension on a curve 
curving to the left having a radius of 75’ a central angle of 19 degrees 33 minutes 25 
seconds a length of 25.60 a chord bearing of South 17 degrees 48 minutes 59 seconds 
East 25.48’ to a point; 
 
Thence (5) still along same, South 27 degrees 35 minutes 42 seconds East 6.25 feet to the 
POINT AND PLACE OF BEGINNING. 
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AN ORDINANCE REPEALING CHAPTER 4, SECTION 12.2(b) OF THE REVISED GENERAL
ORDINANCES OF THE TOWNSHIP OF WEST ORANGE

BE IT ORDAINED BY THE MUNICIPAL COUNCIL OF THE TOWNSHIP OF WEST
ORANGE, NEW JERSEY that Chapter 4 of the Revised General Ordinances of the Township of West
Orange be and are hereby repealed as follows:

I. PURPOSE

The purpose of this Ordinance is to repeal Chapter 4, Section 12.2(b) of the Township of West
Orange (the “Township”) Ordinances on the grounds that it is unconstitutionally vague and is of no use to
the Township. 

II. CHAPTER    4,    SECTION    12.2(b)    SHALL    BE    AND    HEREBY    IS    REPEALED    AS
FOLLOWS

   4-12.2(b)  Certain Types of Loitering Prohibited

   No person shall loiter in a public place in such manner as to:

b. Create or cause to be created any disturbance or annoyance to the comfort and repose of any
person, provided that the disturbance or annoyance would be a disturbance or annoyance to the
comfort and repose of a reasonable person. 

III. REPEAL OF CONFLICTING ORDINANCES

Any Ordinances of the Township which are in conflict with this Ordinance are hereby repealed to
the extent of such conflict.

IV.  SEVERABILITY

If any part of this Ordinance shall be deemed invalid, such parts shall be severed and the
invalidity thereof shall not affect the remaining parts of this Ordinance.

V. EFFECTIVE DATE

This Ordinance shall take effect upon final passage and publication in accordance with the law.

                                                                                                                                                                       
Karen J. Carnevale, R.M.C. Robert D. Parisi, Mayor
Municipal Clerk

                                                                                    
Michelle Casalino, Council President

Introduced: June 23, 2020

Adopted: July 14, 2020

Approved as to form on the basis of the facts provided:
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Legislative History

The purpose of this Ordinance is to repeal subsection (b) of Chapter 4, Section 12.2 on the
grounds that it is unconstitutionally vague and of no use to the Township of West Orange. 
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        June 23, 2020 

 

 

 

RESOLUTION 

 WHEREAS, unless otherwise noted herein, the holders of alcoholic beverage licenses 

from the Township of West Orange set forth on Exhibit A attached hereto and made part hereof, 

have made applications to this Township of West Orange ABC Board to renew said licenses for 

the 2020-2021 license term; and 

 WHEREAS, said licenses have paid all license renewal fees and submitted the 

appropriate application to renew; and 

 WHEREAS, the license was granted 12.39 relief pursuant to N.J.S.A. 33:1-12.39; and 

 WHEREAS, a public hearing was held before the Township of West Orange ABC Board 

on June 23, 2020 and no one appeared in opposition to any license renewal; and 

 NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED that the Township of West Orange ABC 

Board wishes to renew the following alcoholic beverage licenses set forth for the 2020-2021 

license term: 

 

0722-44-027-005 AMI West Orange, LLC (Pocket) 

0722-44-036-011 Jai Ambe Wine & Liquor, LLC 

0722-44-046-009 E.G. Holding Corp., Inc. 

 

 

 

            

KAREN J. CARNEVALE, RMC   MICHELLE CASALINO 

ABC Board Secretary    Council President/ABC Board member 

 

Adopted:  June 23, 2020 




